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Maxitia Project Inc. congratulates Lorena 
Ramos, AAS-MA, on her election as a board 
member of LUPE Fund Inc. This is a well-
deserved honor for Lorena and represents 
another milestone in her progression as a 
community leader and educator. 

The LUPE Fund Inc. 
is an organization 
that has been 
leading the way for 
Latinas in helping to 
advance our 
society. In 2003, 

several Latinas who had an average of more 
than 20 years of experience in law, 
education, human services, business, and 
public policy came together to form LUPE 
Fund Inc. They aimed to increase the 
involvement of Latinas in the political and 
policymaking realms.  

LUPE Fund Inc.'s mission is to educate, 
empower, and engage Latinas to promote 
leadership and civic engagement. LUPE 
Fund Inc. aims to make positive impacts on 
public policy that are relevant to Latinas and 
their families. The LUPE Fund Inc. board 
members represent a broad range of Latina 
community leaders from various sectors of 
society. They are all professionals and 
leaders who excel in their areas of 

expertise. Their wealth of experience is 
essential for LUPE Fund Inc.'s many 
innovative programs.  

As the Latino community develops and 
becomes one of the foundations of American 
society, LUPE Fund Inc. is at the forefront of 
the process.  Building strong leaders who 
can advance quality of life issues for diverse 
communities in New Jersey requires the 
critical use of education and civic 
engagement for young women at this time. 

Maxitia Project Inc. is confident that Lorena 
Ramos will enhance the work done by the 
LUPE Fund Inc. Just as she is an asset to our 
community-based programs. Lorena is our 
New Jersey Community outreach 
coordinator. Our highly successful programs 
in New Jersey have been made possible by 
her leadership and knowledge of the Latino 
community in New Jersey. 

Maxitia Project Inc. supports the LUPE Fund 
Inc. and its excellent work. We are confident 
that Lorena Ramos, AAS-MA will be an asset 
to LUPE Fund Inc. 
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